014-13 Fertilizer and Delivery Quote

John Deere

PRIDE Enterprises | Diamond Fertilizer Harrell's, LLC Landscapes
Item & Est Usage in |Cost per Cost per Cost per Cost per
Description pounds 50lb bag |Total Price 50lb bag ([Total Price 50lb bag ([Total Price 50lb bag |Total Price
8-2-12 Fertilizer 5,000 S 2484 (S 2,484.00|S 2254 |S 2,25400|S 6895|S 6,895.00|S 23.24|S 2,324.00
15-1-15 Fertilizer | 20,000 [$ 21.79[$ 8716.00 [$ 19.76 | 7,904.00 [ $ 19.65|$ 7,860.00 | § 456998 S 6,276.00
8-2-10 Fertilizer 20,000 S 1451(S$ 5,804.00|S 12.74|S$S 5,096.00|S 13.16|S 5,26400|S 19.35(S 7,740.00
0-0-50 Fertilizer 4,000 no bid no bid $ 2052 |$ 1,64160|S$ 23.15|S$ 1,852.00|S 26.27|S$S 2,101.60
0-0-20 Fertilizer 6,000 no bid no bid S 1458 |S 1,749.60 S 16.69 S 2,002.80
19-0-19 Fertilizer 9,000 S 2227 |S 4,00860 (S 21.42(S 3,855.60 S 2349 (S 4,228.20
18-0-18 Fertilizer 16,000 S 2223(S$ 7,113.60|S 20.78|S$ 6,649.60 S 19.29 (S 6,172.80
21-0-0 Fertilizer 10,000 no bid no bid $ 1352 |$ 2,70400|S$ 1535|S$ 3,070.00 | S 1554 |S$ 3,108.00
20-2-10 Fertilizer 10,000 S 22.74|S 4,548.00|S 20.84|S$S 4,168.00 S 2030 (S 4,060.00
15-0-15 Oxidation | 10,000 no bid no bid S 28.90|S 5,780.00 no bid no bid
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